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ABSTRACT 
 

 

Agricultural landscapes in the EU are undergoing fundamental changes, revealing an increasing 
interest in Short Food supply chains as a tool to promote both local products and their food systems. 
Despite small farmers are the backbone of the EU agricultural system and represent the most relevant 
primary mode of farming production, it seems that the policy leadership has been not sufficiently 
fostering their position in the socio and economic today’s narrative. The present study aims at deep-
diving two different issues: analyzing the role of small farmers and Short Food Supply Chains (SFSCs) 
within the EU legal framework in order to understand whether EU legislation supports or rather 
inhibits this alternative system of production and supply; and investigating the case for California, 
whose approach to the subject matter - often studded with soft law measures and bottom-up strategies 
- is a valid example from which identify potential insights that could improve the EU model.  
Two different regulatory approaches fall under the scope of the present study. On the one hand, the 
top-down strategy adopted at the EU level and which characterized the drafting and implementation 
of both soft law and hard law instruments. On the other, the bottom-up scheme, that guides the 
political scenario and shapes the California legal framework, as part of a common law system. A 
combination of different methodologies has been applied: an investigation of the significant legal 
sources and a deep critical reading of the most notable literature available are merged with a 
comparison between two different systems, confined to the subject of research. This approach 
provides the author with enough tools to widen her perspectives and to wear interdisciplinary lens to 
connect sociological, environmental, and legal studies. 
Chapter 1 covers a broad analysis of different definitions of small farmers and SFSCs that have been 
laid down at different levels. The latter is followed by a critical revision of the most significant CAP 
reforms in Chapter 2 and an investigation of the potential positive outcomes of the post-2020 CAP 
due to the advent of the ‘Farm to Fork’ strategy in Chapter 3. The rural development has indeed been 
considerably reformed, and new priorities more favorable to small farmers were set. Nevertheless, as 
pointed out in Chapter 4 - which gives an overview of the present legislation of the food safety system 
concerning small farmers -, the ambitions included in the new political approach remain unsatisfied. 
Chapter 5 is dedicated to the examination of California’s approach to the governance of small farmers 
and local food systems, to understand what is the lesson that the Europeans can learn from a model 
more social- and less law-oriented. Due to the absence of the national political and legal intervention 
and the massive use of de-regulation and self-regulation strategies, Alternative Food Movements 
(AFMs) took the stage. Nevertheless, intervening exclusively with social measures rather than 
promoting a change in the existing regulatory framework seems not to bring adequate results as well. 
By identifying drawbacks and potential benefits of California’s model, the study provides some 
insights as concerns the integration of the EU ‘regulatory’ and top-down approach with a perspective 
more prone to social issues, acknowledging that the narrative around agriculture cannot be reduced 
only to legal jargon but should be always evaluated in light of the cultural and social roots of the 
communities involved. Finally, Chapter 6 gathers all the outcomes of each previous section to provide 
an answer to the initial research question and some final remarks that allow identifying the way 



forward. The current legal framework seems less and less inhibiting the support for small farmers to 
date but an effective integration between short and long supply chain is not yet recognizable. 
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